ROCKDALE COUNTY

ITB# 23-30: Fire Uniforms 1/11/2024 BID OPENING 2:00 P.M.
BID TABULATION SHEET
Nomier Vendor ttem #1 Item #1 Item #2 ftem #2 Item #3 ltem #3 Item #4 Item #4 Item #5 ftem #5 ltem #6 item #6 Item #7 item #7 item #8 ltem #8 Oversize
g o] i Regut: (o) i gul Oversi gl O i gul: o i g o] i Regular Oversize Regular
1 T & T Uniforms, Inc. $140.00 $168.00 $140.00 $168.00 $149.00 $178.80 $68.00 $82.00 $35.00 $39.00 $48.00 $57.00 $49.00 $52.00 $140.00 No Bid
2 Galls, LLC $155.00 $155.00 $132.00 $132.00 $152.50 $152.50 $58.00 $58.00 $18.00 $18.00 $42.00 $42.00 $12.00 $12.00 $115.00 $115.00
3 NAFECO $140.00 HN/A $140.00 “*N/A $152.00 N/A $63.00 $70.00 $35,00 $39.00 $35.00 $39.00 $73.00 “*N/A $110.00 No Bid
*No *No *No No upsi
4 Read's Uniforms $140.25 oversize $142.73 oversize $163.13 oversize $51.67 varies $43.04 $45.45 $34.24 $36.15 $32.56 $37.63 $122.86 n_._mw mwm
charges charges charges 9
Number Vendor am® N o em _%3 M0 | yem#11 | Hem#12 | tem#3 | Hem#14 | Hem#s Comments:
gl gl
1 T & T Uniforms, Inc. $100.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $4.50 $8.00 $4.60 $7.32 $3.50
2 Galls, LLC $88.00 $88.00 $85.00 $85.00 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50
3 NAFECO $94.00 No Bid $91.00 No Bid $5.00 $8.00 $8.00 $5.00 $5.00 Clarification Received from Vendor **N/A = No Additional Cost™
4 |Read's Uniforms g95.71 | NOUPSZe | gon7q | Noupsize | g4 $8.00 $3.00 $3.00 $4.00 *Corrected from Vendor's Proposal Bid Form
charges charges
1/11/2024 a\/ 1/25/2024  Date Revised
Date rient N Date




