1/11/2024 BID OPENING 29 i,
BID TABULATION SHEET
Nimber Vendor Item #1 ltem #1 item #2 Item #2 Item #3 Item #3 tem #4 tem #4 item #5 ftem #5 Item #6 tem #6 Item #7 Item #7 item #8 Jtem #8 Oversize
Regular o] i g o] 1 Regular (o] i Regul o, i Regul: (o] i Regul Oversi g [o] i; gul
1 |T&T Uniforms, Inc. $140.00 | $168.00 | $14000 | $168.00 | $149.00 | $178.80 | $68.00 $8200 | $35.00 $30.00 $48.00 $57.00 $49.00 $52.00 $140.00 No Bid
2 |cals, LLC $15500 | $155.00 | $132.00 | $132.00 | $152.50 | $15250 | $58.00 $58.00 | $1800 | $18.00 $42.00 $4200 | $1200 $12.00 $115.00 $115.00
3 |NAFECO $140.00 | NoBid | $14000 | NoBid | $152.00 | NoBid $63.00 $70.00 $35.00 $3900 | $35.00 $39.00 | $73.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid
4 |Read's Uniforms $14025 | NoBid | $14273 | NoBid | $16313 | No Bid $51.67 varies $43.04 $45 45 $34.24 $36.15 $32.56 $37.63 $122.86 Znﬂ“wmwwm
Number Vendor fiemzs .__ma # | itemi0 ._moa_ #0 | yom#11 | hem#12 | Hem#3 | tem#a | Hem#s
g g
1 |T &T Uniforms, Inc $100.00 | NoBid | $10000 | NoBid $4.50 $8.00 $4.60 $7.32 $3.50
2 |Gals, LLe $88.00 $88.00 $85.00 $85.00 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50
3 |NAFECO $94.00 No Bid $91.00 No Bid $5.00 $8.00 $8.00 $5.00 $5.00
i N No upsize No upsize
4 |Read's Uniforms s9571 | e | $9571 | Charges $4.00 $8.00 $3.00 $3.00 $4.00
1111/2024
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