ROCKDALE COUNTY

ITB# 22-31: Traffic Signal Maintenance - As-

Needed Basis
8/18/2022 BID OPENING 2:00 P.M.
BID TABULATION SHEET
Lumin8
Number Service Provided Metro Trafix, LLC :.f:::;:;::: Sunb(-}LItL;I;raffic, Comments
LLC

1 Superintendent Labor - Per Hour No Bid $102.50 $125.00 Sunbelt Traffic, LLC. - Three (3) Hour Minimum on ALL
2 |IMSA Level lll Technician - Per Hour No Bid $95.50 $125.00 Hourly Labor Rates
3 IMSA Level |l Technician - Per Hour No Bid $85.00 $115.00
4 IMSA Leve! | Technician - Per Hour No Bid $60.00 $115.00
5 Lahorer - Per Hour No Bid $52.00 $55.00
6 Trainee/Helper Labor - Per Hour No Bid $47.25 $55.00
7 Other Labor Category (Specify) - Per Hour No Bid $74.25 No Bid

8 Escalation Rate for Unit Labor Rates - Annual 3.00% 4.00% 8.00%

Percent Escalation %

Equipment & Materials Cost-Plus Markup Rate

9 % N/A 5.00% 15.00%
10 Cones, Barriers, & Signage - Per Day No Bid $1,500,00 No Bid
11 Electronic Message Board - Per Day No Bid $225.00 No Bid
12 Jersey Barrier - Per 6 Foot Unit - Per Day No Bid $850.00 No Bid
13 Digger/Auger Truck - Per Day No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Line Truck - Per Day No Bid $750.00 No Bid
15 Bucket Truck - Per Day No Bid $1,000.00 $950.00
16 m‘ggagﬁ’fg delv’\ji':f_%‘;i‘; Signal Loop Detector No Bid $3,450.00 $2,300.00
17 '1“5332?:1‘:;:&,& X & g:('}:e Loop Detector with No Bid $2,400.00 $1,500.00
18 Installation of Additional Lead Wire - Per L.F No Bid $9.75 $11.00
19 :Ets:::;‘l’:n"f g;’?: i 1EiAGYRIESO RS No Bid $5,500.00 $2,550.00
20 Flagman - Regular Time - Per Hour No Bid $65.00 No Bid
21 Flagman - Overtime - Per Hour No Bid $97.50 No Bid
22 Staff Traffic Engineer - Regular Time - Per Hour $95.00 $117.75 $125.00
23 Staff Traffic Engineer - Overtime - Per Hour $385.00 $176.63 $160.00
24 Project Engineer - Regular Time - Per Hour $150.00 $138.50 $145.00
25 Project Engineer - Overtime - Per Hour $150.00 $207.75 $185.00

ﬂml&pm ) 8/18/2022
Meagan Porch Date:



